


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

The views of business… 

“Everyone has been amazed – there has been work done by students 
that has jaw dropped our senior managers.”  

The views of education… 

 “In software development and coding we’re seeing a definite change in 
the creation of code clubs and organisations like Software Cornwall – 
it’s really nice to see.”  



The views of business… 

 

“If you go and knock on the door they will jump at the chance – 
everyone’s keen, there’s no issue about school and colleges not 
wanting things to happen… they welcome contact.”  

“It’s a real variety pack and depends on some of the individual staff 
within the school – with some you get a real sense they are really going 
above and beyond the remit of their role to make things happen; others 
find obstacles to put in the way.”  

“In the majority of schools there is no single point of contact, and often 
no official acknowledgement of the time and travel expense taken out 
from the business to attend.  The first contact into schools is usually to 
reception and if there is no one allotted to manage the relationship, 
businesses get passed from pillar to post.  Response times can be very 
slow, taking months for things to happen, if at all; then businesses lose 
the desire to engage.”  

“Once a relationship is established, they’re really open to trying new 
things – they want to use the business community as an additional 
resource.” 

“Sometimes the timing doesn’t fit in with academic curriculum they 
have planned… Schools need time to arrange transportation, get 
agreement from parents, the children need someone to accompany 
them.” 

“Teachers have a heavy responsibility to fulfil the curriculum and don’t 
necessarily have a business background so it’s unfair to ask them.”  

“We could have a designated business governor on each Governing 
Body.  Someone who’s held responsible, with an item on the agenda 
that asks ‘right, what have we been doing with business?’” 

The views of education... 

“Our links with business are a mix of historical links through contacts 
and also we have a directory of local businesses we know who will 
support us.  Sometimes we get businesses being proactive.  Whenever 
we ask, we find businesses are VERY receptive.” 

 “We invite employers in to talk to students about opportunities and 
generally find they are very willing to do that. The scale of business 
makes a difference in how much time they have available for us.”  

“Teachers are under pressure to get children through exams… we do 
need to make sure children are literate and numerate when they enter 
the workplace.” 



The views of business... 

“We are the custodians of talent and standards – businesses that 
bemoan skills shortage need to define what that criteria is.” 

“There are some great jobs in Cornwall and industry has a responsibility 
to work with young people to help them understand what those jobs 
are… otherwise how will people know? We can’t sit and complain 
without doing something about it.”  

“Better the understanding of the world of work; give young people a 
clearer understanding of pathways... widening aspirations away from 
stereotypical jobs.” 

“Start taking on young people before they leave school or college – 
don’t use Health and Safety legislation as an excuse – it’s difficult but 
not impossible.” 

The views of education... 

 “Offer teaching staff work experience to upskill and learn more about 
their area of expertise… it’s so important for cutting edge companies to 
engage and teach about the opportunities coming through.” 

“Schemes where business people act as mentors to students in schools 
could be of great benefit, especially in providing an opportunity to 
develop vital networking skills.”  

“It would help if there was a database of employers who were willing to 
come and talk to or take one of our students.” 

“It’s all about young people having a better understanding about what 
a sector can offer – if you take construction – it’s not just about 
building, there’s site management, design, office jobs, accounts, admin 
- all the services to support the sector.”  



The views of business... 

“As a family business, we’re firm believers that we have a social 
responsibility to reinvest in the communities in which we operate.”  

“We owe it to the next generation to do so. When I was young growing 
up, you used to be able to walk into any business and see what was 
going on. Society has put barriers up and we need to break down those 
barriers.”  

“For any business that needs to employ a quantity of people, this is a 
great opportunity to raise awareness. A sales and marketing approach 
is what you have to apply to recruitment.  Raising your brand within 
schools and colleges is laying foundations for the future.”    

“Mums and Dads will say: “They’re a good bunch – go and see what 
they’ve got available”. It raises our profile as a responsible employer. 
It’s a chance to demonstrate who you are as a company.” 

“Bringing people into businesses can be expensive so the more you can 
bring in the pipeline will save money in recruitment agencies.  There are 
benefits also for employees - it supports opportunities for self-
development, for example developing presentation skills through talks 
to groups of children.” 

“It works especially well with younger members of staff as children 
relate to them more easily; it doesn’t have to be the senior people.” 

 

The views of education... 

“Schools these days are being asked to operate like businesses; we can 
learn from business ourselves.” 



The views of business... 

“For core areas around engineering and technology, there are 
consistent skills gaps across our industry. It’s how we feed that into 
local colleges and make them aware of that.” 

“There is a skills shortage, but it’s to do with the way further education 
colleges are funded. There’s no mechanism to be forward looking, for 
example, identifying that perhaps there’s going to be a need for lots of 
aerospace engineers in 5 years’ time.” 

“It does start by looking at a future plan - we need to look at what’s 
happening in the next three, five, ten years to ensure young people are 
being developed to take on those sorts of roles.”  

“Most 13-14 year olds get limited or no guidance on careers.  They 
need some real inspiration and that needs to be sorted by the business 
community.” 

“It’s been difficult to get the message about apprenticeships through – 
some schools are just focussed on University.” 

“I definitely agree there is a shortage of suitably qualified individuals in 
Cornwall, but actually I am hearing from businesses that it’s because of 
salaries, not training.  Recruitment problems are mainly around the 
cost of living versus salary rather than the lack of skills.” 

“It’s a bit misleading to say it’s just skills - it’s skills and behaviours to 
be able to challenge, implement change, think creatively and lead large 
numbers of people.”  

“It’s not typically the senior or managerial roles that are a challenge for 
us in the hospitality industry – the attraction and development 
of additional junior chefs and waiters will be a priority as our business 
grows.”   



The views of education... 

“Currently schools are under pressure to get students through exams.  
Results really matter, and when we’re focussing hard on getting the 
best results, we have to design the curriculum to make sure we’re 
reaching students with all those relevant skills.  That’s why businesses 
telling us what they need is really important so we hear that voice and 
can understand that need.”  

“There is definitely a skills shortage – if you look at IT, it changes daily, 
it’s very fast moving - I don’t personally think as a provider my staff 
would be able to stay fully up to date, so it’s about how businesses 
support colleges, by becoming associate lecturers for example.” 

“I don’t necessarily agree there is a skills shortage – employers could do 
a better job of promoting the roles available – students are very 
ambitious, and their view of ambition in life is to leave the county.  One 
of the things I’m very interested in is, in some industries, employers 
sponsor young people – so if employers want them to come back, then 
pay for them to do it.  That would be a really positive relationship 
employers would have too with our young people.” 

“There is something about the image of the core industries in Cornwall 
– such as food for example - that means despite paying and training 
well they are not seen as attractive careers by young people. Ironically, 
they often give access to a range of exciting development opportunities 
not available elsewhere.” 

“The Chamber are doing a lot to get the conversation going and the 
more we get business articulating what they want the more responsive 
we can be. The notion of the Chamber extending their reach to have 
conversations is very welcome.” 



The views of business... 

“Businesses want young people to have well developed life skills, not 
just for the workplace but also when they’re representing the business 
and engaging with the wider community.” 

“Basically it all stems back to the fact you need to have education and 
industry working much closer together, so young people are doing 
activities that are much more like business activities.”   

“A key element is teachers and helping them understand the 
opportunities and the need for softer skills; helping them understand 
the context.” 

“It’s a real shame that work experience is not a compulsory element in 
schools.  In a week you can change some challenging behaviour.” 

The views of education... 

“The real thing I think is missing is to get to show students in a 
transferrable setting – they need to understand why it’s relevant. 
Getting them out and learning in a real setting; you can’t beat it. 
Confidence is also a major thing – the more exposure we give them to 
unfamiliar work place environments, the more they become equipped 
to handle these situations and develop that confidence.”  

“If the students are late for work, there are serious consequences – we 
seek to replicate this but there’s nothing like experiencing this for real 
in the workplace.”  

“Schools are starting to wake up to the part they have to play, teaching 
emotional intelligence, but this has only started to be recognised in 
recent years.  It was once thought that these skills were innate and 
couldn’t be taught, but there’s a change in opinion now.”   

“A lot of that comes through their work experience.  Even if they just 
have a part time job in Sainsbury’s, they are developing in customer 
service, confidence and the ability to work with lots of people.  For 
many however, it’s difficult to find a student job or appropriate 
placement.”   

“More exposure to work earlier on in their educational career.  The 
increasing use of tech gadgets and social media also loses the human 
element – so a declining trend overall.  It’s giving people the 
opportunity to learn what’s acceptable and not.” 



The views of business... 

“It is great and something which is really useful… but it’s only the keen 
ones; the minority of children get to do it.” 

“They do a good job but tend not to reach out to those who are 
troubled.  So it’s taken up by those who are already bothered to get 
involved… those already motivated in other walks of life.” 

“There are schemes out there like the Year in Industry initiative... there 
are something like 600+ businesses registered, to give young people a 
real experience while they’re working out what they want to do. It’s 
getting rave reviews apparently but it seems not many places know 
about it.” 

The views of education... 

“I’m a complete fan; it’s top quality stuff that instils tenacity and 
resilience – we’re thinking about ways to extend it across older and 
younger age groups.” 

“It’s a good first step, but very safe and closely managed.  I liked the 
programmes where young people were given money to set up real 
businesses – that’s a braver step.  Young people do need acceptance 
that things can fail – that’s good learning.” 



The views of business... 

“With colleges and unis, there is no formalised structure – you just 
bump into someone, say: “wouldn’t it be good if we did this” and then 
it goes round in circles.  It only works if somebody is organising and 
coordinating it, but it tends to be kind of sporadic – it’s no one’s job to 
do this.” 

“One thing to be really careful of is where relationships are owned by 
one or two people – for example one teacher or business 
representative, there should be more.” 

“…centralised coordination – a single point of access from business into 
education – it needs to be simple, one point of contact, for the right 
people to make links and know the process is safe to go through.” 

“Employers probably don’t know what routes and opportunities are 
available. A list of all the opportunities to engage with schools and 
colleges in one document would be a great help.”  

“Employers should speak more to other employers, to say ‘come and 
join our activity and see how easy it is to engage’”.  

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

The views of education... 

“I don’t know if there are any schemes where business people are 
mentors to students in schools.  They could teach young people 
networking and so on – it could work.” 

“Having an understanding of educational constraints to meet the 
business need.  Constraints that the awarding bodies put in, and we 
have to deal with.” 

“I genuinely believe that Cornwall has a unique environment in which it 
could foster collaboration between business and education as many 
informal links do exist. What it’s not managed to do yet is turn these 
into formal links that actually practically solve some of these issues.” 



The views of business...  

“Development is key, as you don’t grow your business if you don’t grow 
your people.” 

“Growing your own talent has to be a priority.  It should be on the 
agenda for every business.” 

“There’s a perception that when you finish school, you don’t have to 
learn any more – we need to make people aware of the need to be 
constantly learning and doing - we need people who are passionate 
about learning.” 

“Make sure [new joiners] get an exceptional welcome to the business.  
Start as you mean to go on – regular support and guidance; technical 
and service development and then aspiring to manager level.”   

“Little and often is our mantra – more regular, informal conversations 
in terms of development goals and activity.” 

“We’ve developed our own mentoring programme to share knowledge 
and experience across other areas of the group.” 

“Employers don’t value ongoing training unless they see immediate 
financial benefit. Tech companies keep employers up to speed on 
technical aspects and will invest in industry training or peer to peer 
learning, but for less obvious skills, they resort to development only in 
competency or capability situations.” 

“CPD is not embedded into workplaces. Someone has to have a real 
interest in something to keep up to date and research latest 
developments. Appraisals if done at all are done badly.” 

“We’re fortunate being part of a big group so there are opportunities 
to do CPD. We have management programmes and courses each year 
so there is a constant flow – it’s all about behavioural side of leadership 
and management and part of our succession planning strategy. For a 
single business at one site it’s a bit trickier to find open courses that are 
right and relevant.  Could SMEs collaborate and share those 
developments?” 

“At present, evening classes are not vocational – this all goes down to 
coordinating the needs of business.  One of the key things that needs to 
happen is for us to advise education where the actual need is.”  



The views of education... 

“We have CPD programmes for teachers and future leaders – maybe 
we could get business and education running joint sessions, certainly 
on soft skills… we could act as a foundation.”  

“There is flexibility for us to work with employers to develop the right 
type of training to develop the workforce.”   

“In some instances there can be some reticence in having to pay for 
skills development, but if training is of a quality that businesses think 
will have a positive impact on turnover it’s no problem.  We’ve 
increasingly seen employers and individuals prepared to pay to develop 
their business and progress their careers.”  

“There is a role for the Chamber of Commerce or FSB to model training 
for smaller businesses.  The SMEs that train and develop their 
workforce compete better and are better at tendering for business; but 
the fear is, if you train someone they will leave.  In actual fact people 
recognise the investment and give back their loyalty in return.” 



From business: 

 

From education: 

 



 


